


































































































Firm Name: ____________________________________________________
PRICING MUST BE PROVIDED NEXT TO EVERY BANDWIDTH INCREMENT ON EACH CIRCUIT BEING BID

 6206 Z1
Appendix A

Revised Version 2

Ci
rc

ui
t # USAC Billed Entity 

Number E 
S 

U BILLED ENTITY NAME
FIBER SITE NAME

BANDWIDTH (Mbps)
SEEKING 

CIRCUIT 
TOPOLOGY--  

PICK ONE

CIRCUIT 
HANDOFF--  
PICK ONE Non-recurring 

Omaha PKI, 
1110 S. 67th, 

Room 166

Total Monthly 
Recurring-- 
Omaha PKI,  
1110 S. 67th, 

Room 166
Taxes and 

Fees
TOTAL 48-

MONTH COST

Non-recurring 
Omaha,     

1623 Farnam, 
Ste 500

Total 
Monthly 

Recurring-- 
Omaha,          

1623  
Farnam, Ste 

500
Taxes and 

Fees
TOTAL 48-

MONTH COST

Non-recurring 
Lincoln,       

901 N. 17th, 
Room 230

Total 
Monthly 

Recurring--
Lincoln,             

901 N. 17th, 
Room 230  

Taxes and 
Fees

TOTAL 48-
MONTH COST

Non-
recurring 
Norfolk, 
NCC, 801 

E 
Benjamin 
Ave, Rm 

283

Total 
Monthly 

Recurring-- 
Norfolk, 

NCC, 801 E 
Benjamin 
Ave, Rm 

283
Taxes and 

Fees

TOTAL 48-
MONTH 

COST

Non-recurring 
Grand Island, 
3180 W. Hwy 

34, Room 
208.5 

Total 
Monthly 

Recurring--       
Grand 
Island,     

3180 W. 
Hwy 34, 

Room 208.5 
Taxes and 

Fees
TOTAL 48-

MONTH COST

Non-
recurring 

Scottsbluff, 
4502 Ave I

Total 
Monthly 

Recurring-- 
Scottsbluff,    
4502 Ave I     

Taxes and 
Fees

TOTAL 48-
MONTH 

COST

EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 01

1 138702 1 EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 01 Current Bandwidth = 200
EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 01 200 -$                    457.00$           31.76$      23,460.55$       -$                  457.00$        31.76$      23,460.55$       -$                  457.00$        31.76$      23,460.55$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  457.00$        31.76$      23,460.55$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
211 TENTH ST 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
WAKEFIELD NE 68784-5014 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Jim Hopkins, (402)287-2061 89,427.31$       89,427.31$       89,427.31$       -$           89,427.31$       -$           

2 138608 1 EMERSON-HUBBARD PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 500
EMERSON-HUBBARD HIGH SCHOOL 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
109 W 3RD ST 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
EMERSON NE 68733-0009 65,966.76$       65,966.76$       65,966.76$       -$           65,966.76$       -$           

Site Contact Info Scott Hansen, (402)695-2636

3 150036 1 HOMER COMMUNITY SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 500
HOMER HIGH SCHOOL 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

212 S 3RD BOX 340 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
HOMER NE 68030-0340 65,966.76$       65,966.76$       65,966.76$       -$           65,966.76$       -$           

Site Contact Info Jeff Reed, (402)698-2377

4 138621 1 LAUREL-CONCORD-COLERIDGE  PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 500
LCC HIGH SCHOOL 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
502 WAKEFIELD BOX 8 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
LAUREL NE 68745-0008 65,966.76$       65,966.76$       65,966.76$       -$           65,966.76$       -$           

Site Contact Info Marcus Messersmith, (402)256-3731

5 138275 1 PENDER PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 500
PENDER HIGH SCHOOL 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
609 WHITNEY S BOX 62 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
PENDER NE 68047-0629 65,966.76$       65,966.76$       65,966.76$       -$           65,966.76$       -$           

Site Contact Info Jen Davis, (402)385-3244

6 138671 1 PONCA PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 300
  JACKSON ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 500 -$                    770.00$           53.52$      39,528.72$       -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
  223 NORTH JOHN ST 1000 -$                    1,067.00$       74.16$      54,775.51$       -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
  JACKSON NE 68743 94,304.23$       94,304.23$       94,304.23$       -$           94,304.23$       -$           

Site Contact Info Kristie Hayes, (402)755-5701

7 138673 1 RANDOLPH PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 300
RANDOLPH HIGH SCHOOL 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID -$          -$           -$          -$           NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID -$            -$            -$          -$           
207 N PIERCE BOX 755 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID -$          -$           -$          -$           NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID -$            -$            -$          -$           
RANDOLPH NE 68771-0755 -$                    -$                    -$                    -$           -$                    -$           

Site Contact Info Jim Hixson, (402)337-0252

8 138262 1 UMO N HO N NATION PUBLIC SCHS Current Bandwidth = 500
UMO N HO N NATION HIGH SCHOOL AT MACY 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
206 MAIN ST BOX 280 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
MACY NE 68039-0280

Site Contact Info Kevin LaHood-Burns, (402)837-5622

9 138701 1 WAKEFIELD PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 500
WAKEFIELD HIGH SCHOOL 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
802 HIGHLAND BOX 330 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
WAKEFIELD NE 68784-0330

Site Contact Info Leslie Ziska, (402)287-2012

10 138304 1 WALTHILL PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 300
WALTHILL HIGH SCHOOL 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
602 MAIN ST BOX 3 C 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
WALTHILL NE 68067-0563 65,966.76$       65,966.76$       65,966.76$       -$           65,966.76$       -$           

Site Contact Info Ryan Stansberry, (402)846-5432

11 138308 1 WINNEBAGO PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 500
WINNEBAGO HIGH SCHOOL 500 -$                    571.00$           39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  571.00$        39.68$      29,312.86$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
HWY 77&75 BOX K K 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
WINNEBAGO NE 68071-0769 65,966.76$       65,966.76$       65,966.76$       -$           65,966.76$       -$           

Site Contact Info Dar Bales, (402)878-2224
EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 02

12 138260 2 LYONS-DECATUR NORTHEAST SCHS Current Bandwidth = 1000
LYONS-DECATUR NORTHEAST SECONDARY SCHOOL 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

400 S 5TH BOX 526 1500 -$                    857.00$           59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
LYONS NE 68038-0526 2000 -$                    857.00$           59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Jeff Clark, (402)654-3317 124,643.81$     124,643.81$     124,643.81$     -$           124,643.81$     -$           

13 138287 2 TEKAMAH-HERMAN COMMUNITY SCHS Current Bandwidth = 1000
TEKAMAH HIGH SCHOOL 1000 -$                    714.00$           49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  714.00$        49.62$      36,653.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
112 N 13TH ST 1500 -$                    857.00$           59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
TEKAMAH NE 68061-1044 2000 -$                    857.00$           59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Don Wallace, (402)374-2156 124,643.81$     124,643.81$     124,643.81$     -$           124,643.81$     -$           

14 138297 2 WAHOO PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 700
WAHOO HIGH SCHOOL 700 37,840.00$       866.00$           60.19$      82,296.98$       37,840.00$     866.00$        60.19$      82,296.98$       37,840.00$     866.00$        60.19$      82,296.98$       -$          -$           -$          -$           37,840.00$     866.00$        60.19$      82,296.98$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
2201 N LOCUST 1000 33,110.00$       1,067.00$       74.16$      87,885.51$       33,110.00$     1,067.00$    74.16$      87,885.51$       33,110.00$     1,067.00$    74.16$      87,885.51$       -$          -$           -$          -$           33,110.00$     1,067.00$    74.16$      87,885.51$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
WAHOO NE 68066-1093 1500 13,970.00$       1,866.00$       129.69$    109,762.98$     13,970.00$     1,866.00$    129.69$    109,762.98$     13,970.00$     1,866.00$    129.69$    109,762.98$     -$          -$           -$          -$           13,970.00$     1,866.00$    129.69$    109,762.98$     -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Vicki Ruzicka (402)443-4332 279,945.46$     279,945.46$     279,945.46$     -$           279,945.46$     -$           
EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 08

15 138601 8 BOYD COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 100  . .  
BOYD COUNTY HIGH SCHOOL (SPENCER) 300 -$                    558.00$           38.78$      28,645.49$       -$                  558.00$        38.78$      28,645.49$       -$                  558.00$        38.78$      28,645.49$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  558.00$        38.78$      28,645.49$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
106 E GREIG ST BOX 109 500 -$                    770.00$           53.52$      39,528.72$       -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
SPENCER NE 68777-0109 1000 -$                    1,067.00$       74.16$      54,775.51$       -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Robert Vesely, (402)589-1333 122,949.72$     122,949.72$     122,949.72$     -$           122,949.72$     -$           

16 138601 8 CHAMBERS PUBLIC SCHOOL DIST. Current Bandwidth = 100  
CHAMBERS PUBLIC SCHOOL 100 -$                    1,496.02$       103.97$    76,799.68$       -$                  1,496.02$    103.97$    76,799.68$       -$                  1,496.02$    103.97$    76,799.68$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  1,496.02$    103.97$    76,799.68$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
201 SOUTH A 500 -$                    2,500.00$       172.50$    $ 128.280.00 -$                  2,500.00$    172.50$    $ 128.280.00 -$                  2,500.00$    172.50$    $ 128.280.00 -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  2,500.00$    172.50$    $ 128.280.00 -$            -$            -$          -$           
CHAMBERS NE 68725 1000 -$                    2,900.00$       200.10$    148,804.80$     -$                  2,900.00$    200.10$    148,804.80$     -$                  2,900.00$    200.10$    148,804.80$     -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  2,900.00$    200.10$    148,804.80$     -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Frank Jesse, (402)482-5233 225,604.48$     225,604.48$     225,604.48$     -$           225,604.48$     -$           

17 138487 8 WHEELER CENTRAL SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 150  
WHEELER CENTRAL HIGH AT BARTLETT 200 -$                    559.00$           38.85$      28,696.82$       -$                  559.00$        38.85$      28,696.82$       -$                  559.00$        38.85$      28,696.82$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  559.00$        38.85$      28,696.82$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
600 RANDOLPH WEST BOX 68 500 -$                    770.00$           53.52$      39,528.72$       -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  770.00$        53.52$      39,528.72$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
BARTLETT NE 68622-0068 1000 -$                    1,067.00$       74.16$      54,775.51$       -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  1,067.00$    74.16$      54,775.51$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Paul Nordhues, (308)654-3273 123,001.06$     123,001.06$     123,001.06$     -$           123,001.06$     -$           
EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 17

18 139081 17 EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 17 Current Bandwidth = 400
EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 17 TECH OFFICE 400 -$                    643.00$           44.69$      33,009.05$       -$                  643.00$        44.69$      33,009.05$       -$                  643.00$        44.69$      33,009.05$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  643.00$        44.69$      33,009.05$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
1292 E 4TH STREET BOX 227 500 -$                    679.00$           47.19$      34,857.14$       -$                  679.00$        47.19$      34,857.14$       -$                  679.00$        47.19$      34,857.14$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  679.00$        47.19$      34,857.14$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
AINSWORTH NE 69210-1353 600 -$                    750.00$           52.13$      38,502.00$       -$                  750.00$        52.13$      38,502.00$       -$                  750.00$        52.13$      38,502.00$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  750.00$        52.13$      38,502.00$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Ben Anthony, banthony@esu17.org, 402-387-2520 800 -$                    786.00$           54.63$      40,350.10$       -$                  786.00$        54.63$      40,350.10$       -$                  786.00$        54.63$      40,350.10$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  786.00$        54.63$      40,350.10$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
1000 -$                    857.00$           59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  857.00$        59.56$      43,994.95$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

190,713.24$     190,713.24$     190,713.24$     -$           190,713.24$     -$           

19 139081 17 EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 17 Current Bandwidth = 400
16042611 EDUCATIONAL SERVICE UNIT 17 ADMIN OFFICE 400 1,500.00$         643.00$           44.69$      34,509.05$       1,500.00$       643.00$        44.69$      34,509.05$       1,500.00$       643.00$        44.69$      34,509.05$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       643.00$        44.69$      34,509.05$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

207 N MAIN ST, PO BOX 227 500 1,500.00$         679.00$           47.19$      36,357.14$       1,500.00$       679.00$        47.19$      36,357.14$       1,500.00$       679.00$        47.19$      36,357.14$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       679.00$        47.19$      36,357.14$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
AINSWORTH, NE 69210-1353 600 1,500.00$         750.00$           52.13$      40,002.00$       1,500.00$       750.00$        52.13$      40,002.00$       1,500.00$       750.00$        52.13$      40,002.00$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       750.00$        52.13$      40,002.00$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Ben Anthony, banthony@esu17.org, 402-387-2520 800 1,500.00$         786.00$           54.63$      41,850.10$       1,500.00$       786.00$        54.63$      41,850.10$       1,500.00$       786.00$        54.63$      41,850.10$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       786.00$        54.63$      41,850.10$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
1000 1,500.00$         857.00$           59.56$      45,494.95$       1,500.00$       857.00$        59.56$      45,494.95$       1,500.00$       857.00$        59.56$      45,494.95$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       857.00$        59.56$      45,494.95$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

198,213.24$     198,213.24$     198,213.24$     -$           198,213.24$     -$           

20 139079 17 AINSWORTH COMMUNITY SCHOOLS Current Bandwidth = 1000
AINSWORTH HIGH SCHOOL 1000 1,500.00$         857.00$           59.56$      45,494.95$       1,500.00$       857.00$        59.56$      45,494.95$       1,500.00$       857.00$        59.56$      45,494.95$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       857.00$        59.56$      45,494.95$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
520 E 2ND ST BOX 65 1500 1,500.00$         1,036.00$       72.00$      54,684.10$       1,500.00$       1,036.00$    72.00$      54,684.10$       1,500.00$       1,036.00$    72.00$      54,684.10$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       1,036.00$    72.00$      54,684.10$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
AINSWORTH NE 69210-0065 2000 1,500.00$         1,036.00$       72.00$      54,684.10$       1,500.00$       1,036.00$    72.00$      54,684.10$       1,500.00$       1,036.00$    72.00$      54,684.10$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       1,036.00$    72.00$      54,684.10$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

Site Contact Info Ben Anthony, banthony@esu17.org, 402-387-2520 2500 1,500.00$         1,214.00$       84.37$      63,821.90$       1,500.00$       1,214.00$    84.37$      63,821.90$       1,500.00$       1,214.00$    84.37$      63,821.90$       -$          -$           -$          -$           1,500.00$       1,214.00$    84.37$      63,821.90$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

NEBRASKA GAME AND PARKS COMMISSION
 

21 N/A N/A NEBRASKA GAME & PARKS COMMISSION Current Bandwidth = 250  
  PLATTE RIVER STATE PARK, ADMIN OFFICE 250 -$                    250.00$           17.38$      12,834.00$       -$                  250.00$        17.38$      12,834.00$       -$                  250.00$        17.38$      12,834.00$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  250.00$        17.38$      12,834.00$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
  14421 346TH ST 500 -$                    500.00$           34.75$      25,668.00$       -$                  500.00$        34.75$      25,668.00$       -$                  500.00$        34.75$      25,668.00$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  500.00$        34.75$      25,668.00$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
  LOUISVILLE NE 68037-3001 750 -$                    602.00$           41.84$      30,904.27$       -$                  602.00$        41.84$      30,904.27$       -$                  602.00$        41.84$      30,904.27$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  602.00$        41.84$      30,904.27$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
  Site Contact Info Troy Kroeger, 402-471-5646, troy.kroeger@nebraska.gov 1000 -$                    630.00$           43.79$      32,341.68$       -$                  630.00$        43.79$      32,341.68$       -$                  630.00$        43.79$      32,341.68$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  630.00$        43.79$      32,341.68$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
      101,747.95$     101,747.95$     101,747.95$     -$           101,747.95$     -$           

 
22 N/A N/A NEBRASKA GAME & PARKS COMMISSION Current Bandwidth = 250  
  SCHRAMM PARK STATE REC AREA & AQUARIUM 250 -$                    250.00$           17.38$      12,834.00$       -$                  250.00$        17.38$      12,834.00$       -$                  250.00$        17.38$      12,834.00$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  250.00$        17.38$      12,834.00$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
  21502 W HWY 31 500 -$                    500.00$           34.75$      25,668.00$       -$                  500.00$        34.75$      25,668.00$       -$                  500.00$        34.75$      25,668.00$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  500.00$        34.75$      25,668.00$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
  GRETNA NE 68028 750 -$                    602.00$           41.84$      30,904.27$       -$                  602.00$        41.84$      30,904.27$       -$                  602.00$        41.84$      30,904.27$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  602.00$        41.84$      30,904.27$       -$            -$            -$          -$           
  Site Contact Info Troy Kroeger, 402-471-5646, troy.kroeger@nebraska.gov 1000 -$                    630.00$           43.79$      32,341.68$       -$                  630.00$        43.79$      32,341.68$       -$                  630.00$        43.79$      32,341.68$       -$          -$           -$          -$           -$                  630.00$        43.79$      32,341.68$       -$            -$            -$          -$           

101,747.95$     101,747.95$     101,747.95$     -$           101,747.95$     -$           
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